
Archimedes 
Ethan Williamson 
Age: 28-35 
Female - All Ethnicities 
Program Director - small-town radio station 

Ethan Williamson, known as the serial killer "Archimedes," is a former 
psychology and criminology professor. He targets academics—both 
teachers and students—who fail to meet his high standards. Living by stoic 
principles, he suppresses emotions, except for disgust and annoyance. He 
believes true growth comes only through suffering, and that those who 
have suffered are the only ones worthy of teaching others, provided they 
remain mentally and physically strong. 

Archimedes has a very cool demeanor, and rarely betrays his poker face. 
He is also completely sane and aware of what he is doing, causing a great 
deal of stress and fear in the officers that have captured him. He’s taken to 
pushing himself to become physically fit, mentally strong, and 
psychologically unmoving in his beliefs. 

Voice: Archimedes’ voice should be intelligent, cold, calm, and assured in 
every spoken word. This is a man that wholeheartedly believes in his 
philosophy, and that he is a hero that will pull humans up from the mud if 
they simply obey and listen to his reasoning. When speaking to others he 
deems unworthy he will talk to them like they are disobedient children, or 
misguided adults in need of reasoning. 

Example: Detroit: Become Human - Meet Elijah Kamski, Former CEO Of 
Cyberlife & The Truth About Deviant 
 
Example: The Grand General - Swain quotes

Example: "This universe is finite, its resources, finite. If left Unchecked...." - 
Thanos 
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Line 1: (Archimedes stares intently at Sato, a flicker of something 
unsettling in his gaze.)

“Tell me, Detective...have you ever wondered if true justice lies beyond the 
confines of the law? If a higher purpose might exist, even in the darkest of 
deeds?:

Line 2: (Annoyed at having to entertain visitors to your cell who want to see 
you in the flesh. You hate being treated as a circus act)
As delightful as the company of three new faces are, is there a reason 
you’re choosing to harass me? I haven’t done anything to violate your 
rules, Warden.  

Line 3: (Discussing your philosophy. Your outlook on life is that suffering is 
necessary for people to enjoy life, and because of this people naturally 
WANT to suffer. Do this line like a professor giving a lecture)

Penitent monks. Martial Artists. Bodybuilders. Women wanting to be 
mothers. We suffer for what we want. It’s why today’s youth are faltering. 
There were no problems to suffer, so they made their own. They desire it. 
They inflict suffering without a second thought because it’s not ‘they’ who 
suffer. They don’t understand the ramifications of their actions. Exploiting 
their fans on social media for money, bringing newborns into the world they 
have no capability of giving a good or decent life, destroying people’s 
reputations out of sheer boredom. They’re desperate to understand. Even if 
they don’t know it. 
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